
   
 

Shape of Dreams Receives New Update and Limited-Time Event 
Ahead of February’s Steam Next Fest 

 
Starting on Feb. 25, 2025, explore the Rapids and customize your hero with an updated Steam 

demo available to all players 
 

 
 

 
 

SOUTH KOREA – February 25, 2025 – Action roguelike Shape of Dreams, the debut 
title from four-player Korean studio Lizard Smoothie, will participate in this month’s 
Steam Next Fest with an updated demo. The demo brings a new in-game event as well 
as many updates including cosmetic customization, Daydream in-game quests, a 
rework to the Essence system, an emoji-styled chat interaction, and more.  
 
“Thanks to the enthusiastic response from our community, we’ve compiled feedback on 
Shape of Dreams to support an updated demo for Steam Next Fest, “ said Eunseob 
Shim, co-founder and CEO, Lizard Smoothie. “We are grateful to NEOWIZ as a 
publishing partner, as they’ve empowered our small studio to deliver our game to a 

https://store.steampowered.com/app/2444750/Shape_of_Dreams
https://store.steampowered.com/app/2444750/Shape_of_Dreams
https://store.steampowered.com/app/2444750/Shape_of_Dreams


bigger audience. We look forward to hearing more feedback from this event to help us 
enhance gameplay ahead of release later this year.” 
 

 

  
 
Published by South Korean game company NEOWIZ, Shape of Dreams is a hybrid of 
Multiplayer Online Battle Arena (MOBA) and roguelike action battle gameplay with up to 
4 players in co-op. As a global leader in console, PC, and mobile gaming, their latest 
partnership with Lizard Smoothie continues their commitment to working with indie 
developers to publish a diverse catalog of titles that appeal to audiences worldwide.  
 
To learn more about NEOWIZ’s publishing initiatives, please visit the NEOWIZ website. 
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[Click HERE for assets] 
 
About NEOWIZ 
Established in 1997, NEOWIZ is a global leader in gaming, renowned for blending 
remarkable storytelling with exceptional gameplay mechanics. With a legacy spanning 
over two decades, NEOWIZ has solidified its position as one of Korea's foremost game 
companies, captivating audiences worldwide with diverse PC, consoles and mobile 

https://www.neowiz.com/
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titles. Recent successes include Lies of P, Brave Nine, DJMAX RESPECT and Cats & 
Soup, all emblematic of NEOWIZ's commitment to excellence and gamers worldwide. 
Welcome to NEOWIZ, where legends come to life. 
 
About Lizard Smoothie 
Lizard Smoothie was founded in January 2023 by two college students who love 
MOBAs and indie games. The team’s debut title, Shape of Dreams, is an upcoming 
MOBA-styled action roguelike that was developed with the sole intention of creating a 
game that is fun for developers and indie game enthusiasts to play. The team’s work 
has been recognized by various awards from organizations like GIGDC, IndieGo, BIC, 
and more. 
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